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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < < N T 4awm E 0 © E mn LT W,
ITEM 1 |PVC C900 Pipe Class 150 (DR18)
PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 2.03 2.12 2.22 2.37 6.50
1. 4" PVC (C900) Pipe (SAWS #14781) TOTAL 2,030.00 2,120.00 2,220.00 2,370.00 6,500.00
PRICE
10,000 ft. EACH 4.02 4.22 4.42 4.70 8.50
2. 6" PVC (C900) Pipe (SAWS #14788) TOTAL 40,200.00 42,200.00 44,200.00 47,000.00 85,000.00
PRICE
10,000 ft. EACH 6.97 7.31 7.64 8.14 12.50
3. 8" PVC (C900) Pipe (SAWS #14792) TOTAL 69,700.00 73,100.00 76,400.00 81,400.00 125,000.00
PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 10.45 10.98 11.48 12.24 24.62
4, 10" PVC (C900) pipe (SAWS #14758) TOTAL 10,450.00 10,980.00 11,480.00 12,240.00 24,620.00
PRICE
7,500 ft. EACH 14.76 15.50 16.21 17.25 25.50
5. 12" PVC (C900) Pipe (SAWS #14758) TOTAL 110,700.00 116,250.00 121,575.00 129,375.00 191,250.00
Total for Item No. 1 TOTAL 233,080.00 244,650.00 255,875.00 272,385.00 432,370.00
ITEM 2 |PVC (C905) Pipe Class 235 (DR18)
PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 28.76 27.24 29.44 30.42 49.35
1. 16" PVC (C905) Pipe (SAWS #14726) TOTAL 28,760.00 27,240.00 29,440.00 30,420.00 49,350.00
PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 44.19 43.95 47.27 48.48 69.65
2. 20" PVC (C905) Pipe (SAWS #14727) TOTAL 44,190.00 43,950.00 47,270.00 48,480.00 69,650.00
PRICE
2,000 ft. EACH 65.49 67.84 69.48 75.25 94.25
3. 24" PVC (C905) Pipe (SAWS #14725) TOTAL 130,980.00 135,680.00 138,960.00 150,500.00 188,500.00
*
Total for Item No. 2 TOTAL 203,930.00 206,870.00 215,670.00 229,400.00 307,500.00
ITEM 3 PVC (C909) Pipe Class 150
PRICE
3,000 ft. EACH 3.99 4.21 4.42 4.69 No Bid
1. 6" PVC (C909) Pipe (SAWS #22391) TOTAL 11,970.00 12,630.00 13,260.00 14,070.00
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < < N T aw;m E 0 © X E 0 U L < 0
PRICE
6,000 ft. EACH 6.92 7.12 7.64 8.09 No Bid
2. 8" PVC (C909) Pipe (SAWS #22392) TOTAL 41,520.00 42,720.00 45,840.00 48,540.00
PRICE
500 ft. EACH 10.39 10.69 11.48 11.97 No Bid
3. 10" PVC (C909) Pipe (SAWS #22393) TOTAL 5,195.00 5,345.00 5,740.00 5,985.00
PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 14.66 15.10 16.21 16.99 No Bid
4. 12" PVC (C909) Pipe (SAWS #22394) TOTAL 14,660.00 15,100.00 16,210.00 16,990.00
*
No Bid
Total for Item No. 3 TOTAL 73,345.00 75,795.00 81,050.00 85,585.00
TOTAL ITEMS 1-3 TOTAL 510,355.00 527,315.00 552,595.00 587,370.00 No Bid
EXTENSION 1 510,355.00
EXTENSION 2 510,355.00
EXTENSION 3 510,355.00
2% Net 0% Net Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 21 days 7-10 days 7-15 days 2 weeks
1
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe & Supply John Holloway Demandstar
Cascade Water Works Morrison Supply Co. SAWS Website
Ferguson Municipal Water Works Supply

HD Supply Water Works




